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Message from the Guest Editors

Herbs and related agricultural crops contain many
functional ingredients (phytochemicals) that can maintain
human health, so that the products produced have the
function of preventing chronic diseases, such as
cardiovascular diseases, diabetes, cancer, and Alzheimer's
disease. Therefore, there are many ways to improve
functions in health products, such as: 1. Scientifically verify
the function and mechanism of phytochemicals in herbs
and agricultural crops; 2. Increase the content and stability
of these phytochemicals through new processing methods;
3. Add phytochemicals to enrich health products; 4.
Purification and separation from the crude extracts;  5.
Standardized production process to obtain the maximum
quality and amounts of the active index compounds; and 6.
Verify the safety of health products or the extracts. We
expect that the research on this Special Issue, ‘Bioactive
Compounds in Agricultural Products and Their Functional
Characteristics’, can promote the health of human beings.
Meanwhile, it can also strengthen the development and
utilization of active ingredients in agricultural products.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Agriculture (ISSN 2077-0472) is an international,
crossdisciplinary and scholarly open access journal on the
science and technology of crop and animal production,
and management of the natural resource base for
agricultural production. Agriculture is published in an open
access format – research articles, reviews and other
contents are released on the internet immediately aDer
acceptance. The scientific community and the public have
unlimited and free access to the content as soon as it is
published.
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