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Message from the Guest Editors

The genetic basis of crops is crucial for the improvement of
crop varieties, the improvement of stress resistance, and
the adaptation of crops to new environments. In the
context of global climate change and population growth, a
deeper understanding of the genetic basis of crops can
help address major challenges, including global food
security and sustainable agricultural development.

The purpose of this Special Issue is to explore the genetic
basis of crop selection and evolution and investigate the
genetic mechanisms of crop variety formation, adaptive
evolution, and interaction with the environment. Through
comprehensive literature reviews and original research
articles, this Special Issue focuses on revealing the critical
role of the crop’s genetic background in crop biology to
promote a deeper understanding of crop growth and
development, physiological function, and environmental
responses.

Research areas that will be covered in this Special Issue
include, but are not limited to, genomics, epigenetics,
germplasm resource utilization, and genetic improvement
strategies.
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Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Leslie A. Weston
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Water and Environment
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Agronomy draws together researchers from diverse areas
of agricultural research with a common aim of enhancing
agricultural productivity globally. The journal provides
unlimited free access to all those interested in advancing
agricultural science from both the research and general
community. Papers are released immediately a<er
acceptance through the internet. Agronomy is supported
by our authors and their institutes through low article
processing charges (APC) for accepted papers. We hope
you will support the journal by becoming one of our
authors.
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