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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

This Special Issue welcomes full papers from abstracts
presented at the symposium “Advocating for Insects as
Food and Feed", held as part of the 67th Annual Meeting of
the Entomological Society of America on November 2019,
in St. Louis, MO. Manuscripts discussing entomological
research which directly explores the biology of insects in
animal feed by assessing insect performance and factors
influencing current insect production operations will be
considered with the aim to enhance animal feed
applications. Highlighted research areas for improving
animal feed, health and nutrition applications include
supply chain considerations, economics and regulatory
issues of insect farming, optimizing nutrient composition
and feed ingredient safety in the use of insects in animal
feed, and utilizing basic biological and animal husbandry
principles to enhance insect production.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous peerreview
and editorial processes and publishes only high quality
manuscripts that address important issues in the many
varied disciplines that involve animals, with a focus on
animal science, animal welfare and animal ethics. Animals
is covered in the Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE) in
Web of Science, with the latest Impact Factor: 3.0 (2022,
ranks 12 /62 (Q1) in ‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal Science’;
13/143 (Q1) in ‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year Impact Factor:
3.2.
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