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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Minimally invasive procedures are becoming increasingly
available for veterinary patients, both in referral and non-
referral settings. New minimally invasive approaches and
procedures are regularly described in the peer-reviewed
literature. Implementing the best current knowledge while
performing MIS is critical for veterinarians who aspire to
consistently achieve the best possible outcome for their
patients. Our goal is to encourage scientists to publish their
experimental and theoretical research in as much detail as
possible.

The purpose of this Special Issue is therefore to present
high-quality documents related to minimally invasive
veterinary surgery in the broad sense, and for so9 and
orthopedic tissues. Research articles, case series and
original reviews are invited to this Special Issue. Topics
could include, by way of example, case selection and/or
prognosis assessment, peri- and intraoperative treatments
and procedures to improve outcomes, surgical techniques,
surgical instrumentation, post-therapy assistance and
complication management.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous peerreview
and editorial processes and publishes only high quality
manuscripts that address important issues in the many
varied disciplines that involve animals, with a focus on
animal science, animal welfare and animal ethics. Animals
is covered in the Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE) in
Web of Science, with the latest Impact Factor: 2.7 (2023,
ranks 10/80 (Q1) in ‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal
Science’; 16/167 (Q1) in ‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year
Impact Factor: 3.0.
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