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Message from the Guest Editors

Antibiotics targeting Mycobacterium tuberculosis have
been around for more than 75 years now. However,
treatment of tuberculosis is extremely challenging and
mandates the use of multiple drugs in a strict regimen to
effect a successful cure.

The main requisites for a candidate new drug against TB
are

    Good cidal activity to be able to rapidly reduce the
bacterial population and thereby minimize further
transmission;
    (Better?) activity against the bacteria during the
persistent phase to ensure quick and complete cure;
    Low frequency of drug resistance.

Targeting persistent subpopulations is extremely crucial if
we are to achieve the goal of shortening the duration of TB
therapy. Recent advances in single-cell biology and
imaging have helped us to gain an understanding of some
of the challenges to achieving these goals. This Special
Issue seeks manuscript submissions that expand our
understanding of the mechanisms M. tuberculosis adopts
to survive and persist against antibiotics. Submissions on
approaches to identify compounds that can specifically
target these persisting subpopulations are especially
encouraged.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

There are very few fields that attract as much attention as
scientific endeavor related to antibiotic discovery, use and
preservation. The public, patients, scientists, clinicians,
policy-makers, NGOs, governments, and supra-
governmental organizations are all focusing intensively on
it: all are concerned that we use our existing agents more
effectively, and develop and evaluate new interventions in
time to face emerging challenges for the benefit of present
and future generations. We need every discipline to
contribute and collaborate: molecular, microbiological,
clinical, epidemiological, geographic, economic, social
scientific and policy disciples are all key. Antibiotics is a
nimble, inclusive and rigorous indexed journal as an
enabling platform for all who can contribute to solving the
greatest broad concerns of the modern world.
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