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Message from the Guest Editors

NAFLD is a high prevalent disease worldwide, and it is the
leading cause of liver-related morbidity and mortality.
However, oxidative and inflammatory determinants of this
disease have been not fully described. Diet, lifestyle, and
co-morbidities are just some of other determinants
involved in the genesis and evolution of this disease
through modifying oxidative/inflammatory status. There
are two types of NAFLD are nonalcoholic fatty liver and
nonalcoholic steatohepatitis, and Metabolic dysfunction-
associated fatty liver disease has been lately described,
which uses the same standard for NAFLD and NASH, but
identifying metabolic dysregulatory factors as requisite for
the diagnosis, including metabolic syndrome. Oxidative
and inflammatory status are determinants of these
diseases. According to diet and lifestyle, this status may be
modified. Further information on these determinants will
be useful to improve fatty liver status, its prognosis, and
evolution, and hence the public health. This Special Issue
will cover all aspects of the role of determinants of NAFLD
and its so-morbidities, aiming to provide further
knowledge of lifestyle improvement of NAFLD.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

It has been recognized in medical sciences that in order to
prevent adverse effects of “oxidative stress” a
balance exists between prooxidants and antioxidants in
living systems. Imbalances are found in a variety of
diseases and chronic health situations. Our journal
Antioxidants serves as an authoritative source of
information on current topics of research in the area of
oxidative stress and antioxidant defense systems. The
future is bright for antioxidant research and since 2012,
Antioxidants has become a key forum for researchers to
bring their findings to the forefront.
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