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Message from the Guest Editors

Biofertilizers made up of microorganisms from
phytobiomes are increasingly important for enhancing
plant growth, nutrition, health, and stress resilience, and
are seen as a solution to issues such as soil degradation,
environmental contamination, ecosystem disturbance, and
human health hazards in agroecosystems. However, there
are challenges associated with the appropriate selection of
safe and effective bioinoculants, successful delivery and
establishment, and reliable and repeatable efficacy of
biofertilizers and microbials in the field. Advancements in
biofertilizer research aim to improve formulations, develop
alternative delivery approaches, consider plant-
microbiome assembly and dynamics, and incorporate
microbiome-based concepts and plant-microbe-
microbiome interactions. These advancements are guided
by the development of omics-related technologies and
analyses. With agroecosystems under increasing
environmental stress from anthropogenic climate change
and contaminants, biofertilizers and microbials are
potential key players in finding solutions towards
sustainable development.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of the
ever increasing number of subfields being created. This
open access journal Applied Sciences has been started to
link these subfields, so researchers can cut through the
forest and see the surrounding, or quite distant fields and
subfields to help develop his/her own research even further
with the aid of this multi-dimensional network.
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