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Message from the Guest Editor

Dust is one of the most important aerosols in the Earth
system. It directly alters radiative fluxes in the atmosphere.
The redistribution of radiative energy by dust aerosols
influences the thermodynamic environment for cloud
formation, which also affects the hydrological cycle and
large-scale atmospheric circulation. Dust particles are also
involved in cloud microphysical processes. Dust particles
take up trace gases by heterogeneous chemical reactions,
they mix with other aerosols, and they are very important
for the biogeochemical cycles of the planet. Bacteria and
fungi are advected with dust, potentially affecting human
health.

For this Special Issue, we invite you to present your new
research on the diverse and complex properties of soil dust
aerosols as well as how dust aerosols are involved in the
various processes in the Earth system. Both measurement
and modeling studies are welcome.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Continued developments in instrumentation and modeling
have driven atmospheric science to become increasingly
more complex with a deeper understanding of concepts,
mechanisms, and interactions. This is the field that
innovation built and it has led to a better appreciation for
the complexity with atmosphere. Human life is intertwined
in this complexity as we strive to better understand our
atmosphere. Climate change is constantly stretching the
limits of our thinking and forcing new ideas and concepts
to be played out. Welcome to the Anthropocene!
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