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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Microbial metabolites are compounds that
microorganisms use to complete their own life activities.
They include primary metabolites such as amino acids,
lipids, and organic acids, and secondary metabolites such
as antibiotics. Different microorganisms produce different
metabolites, resulting in diverse structures of metabolites
that are widely used in medicine and industry. The
biosynthesis of metabolites also provides new ideas and
breakthroughs for research in the life sciences.

For this Special Issue, research on the regulation
mechanism of metabolite biosynthesis and analyses of the
metabolite biosynthesis process are welcome for
submission. Moreover, submissions of research on the
biological activity of metabolites are also welcome.
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Message from the Editorial Board

A major strength of biological science is the diversity of
approaches that biological scientists apply to their
research problems. Biology reflects this diversity and brings
together studies employing the varied experimental and
theoretical approaches that are fueling biological
discovery. Biology, the journal, is a fully peer-reviewed
publication with a rapid and economical route to open
access publication and is listed on PubMed. All articles are
peer-reviewed and the editorial focus is on determining
that the work is scientifically sound rather than trying to
predict its future impact.
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