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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Colorectal cancer (CRC) is one of the most common
malignancies worldwide. Therapeutic approaches vary
according to tumor location (colonic or rectal) and pTNM
stage, the latter representing a main prognostic factor.

In spite of the improvement in the early diagnosis and
therapy of CRC, several issues are still open. First, the
identification of factors associated with a high risk of
progression in non-metastatic (pN0M0) CRC still represents
a research challenge and means it would be relevant to
select patients for adjuvant treatments. Second, in view of
the spreading endoscopic resection of CRC, predictors of
nodal metastases in pT1 tumors would help in identifying
patients needing surgery. Finally, pre-treatment clinical,
endoscopic, or histological features able to predict the
response of rectal adenocarcinoma to neo-adjuvant
chemo-radiotherapy (CRT) would be useful to design
tailored therapeutic strategies.

The aim of this Special Issue is to provide new insights into
prognostic and predictive factors for early or pN0M0 CRC,
and for locally advanced rectal carcinoma treated with
neo-adjuvant CRT. These could be useful to develop
individualized treatments.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Biomedicines (ISSN 2227-9059) is an open access journal
devoted to all aspects of research on human health and
disease, the discovery and characterization of new
therapeutic targets, therapeutic strategies, and research of
naturally driven biomedicines, pharmaceuticals, and
biopharmaceutical products. Topics include pathogenesis
mechanisms of diseases, translational medical research,
biomaterial in biomedical research, natural bioactive
molecules, biologics, vaccines, gene therapies, cell-based
therapies, targeted specific antibodies, recombinant
therapeutic proteins, nanobiotechnology driven products,
targeted therapy, bioimaging, biosensors, biomarkers, and
biosimilars. The journal is open for publication of studies
conducted at the basic science and preclinical research
levels. We invite you to consider submitting your work to
Biomedicines, be it original research, review articles, or
developing Special Issues of current key topics.
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