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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Climate change directly or indirectly affects various
research fields. Since the pioneering work carried out in
1960s and 1970s, the climate model has become a critical
tool to improve our understanding of climate change from
seasonal to even longer timescales. Models of the various
components of the climate system may be coupled to
produce increasingly complex models, such as the Earth
system model, which is the nucleus of the most complex
atmosphere and ocean models, and carbon cycle
processes. Advanced climate modeling and observations
can improve accurate prediction of climate change and
long-term trends.

To further our understanding of our climate changing
system, we are calling for original research papers related
to climate modeling and observations in this Special Issue.
This includes the multidisciplinary exercise of global
climate models and regional climate models, mitigation
studies of extreme weather events, more sophisticated
future predictions and projections of the earth system by
coupling with other Earth system components, and some
new artificial intelligence, such as artificial neural networks,
random forest, and support vector machines. 
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