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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Proton therapy can improve the treatment outcomes for
patients with head and neck cancer while minimizing the
side effects. Moreover, recent advances in proton therapy
technology, including image-guided techniques and
intensity modulated proton therapy (IMPT), have further
enhanced its efficacy and safety in treating head and neck
cancer. We encourage submissions that explore the latest
research findings in proton therapy for head and neck
cancer. Manuscripts may cover topics including, but not
limited to, the treatment protocols, patients’ outcomes,
comparative studies, technology innovations, and the
radiobiological and dosimetric considerations of proton
therapy for head and neck cancer.

I look forward to receiving your contributions.

Dr. Suresh Rana
Guest Editor
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

I am honored and enthusiastic to serve as incoming Editor-
in-Chief of Current Oncology. Since its establishment in
1994, Current Oncology has been playing an important role
in the advancement of cancer care by disseminating new
knowledge in the cancer care continuum. Current
Oncology is affiliated with several key cancer societies and
provides a global platform to share scientific progress in
oncology. We strive for high standards and work together
to maintain a rigorous and unbiased peer review process
to publish high-quality articles. We have an outstanding
editorial team which is committed to the success of Current
Oncology.
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