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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

The aim of this Special Issue is to provide information on
the current and potential use of precision medicine in
geriatric urology. Geriatric urology encompasses a
multifactorial clinical syndrome with an extremely
complicated clinical course, and is very diverse with
respect to clinical patterns. Early diagnosis is of crucial
importance for the final clinical outcome. Previous studies
have not identified a biomarker with sufficient sensitivity
and specificity for the diagnosis of geriatric urologic
disease. Therefore, we are currently collecting clinical data
and molecular biomarkers using “omics” technologies,
with sufficient diagnostic specificity and sensitivity to be
able to predict the clinical course of the disease and
patient response to therapy. All analyses consider the
precise medicine and patient engagement practice in
order to provide readers with a useful tool for everyday
clinical practice. We hope to provide readers with an
interesting tool for use in everyday clinical practice and
invite urology experts to share their experiences.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

You are cordially invited to submit research articles, short
communications, comprehensive reviews, case reports or
interesting images for consideration and publication in
Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418). Diagnostics is published in
open access format – research articles, reviews and other
contents are released on the Internet immediately aDer
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited and free access to the content as
soon as it is published. We would be pleased to welcome
you as one of our authors.
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