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Message from the Guest Editor

Many aspects in our day-to-day life are directly related to
heat transfer and fluid flow phenomena. The Special Issue
in Advances in Thermal and Fluid Science provides an
open-access forum specifically devoted to latest advances
in all areas of heat transfer and fluid science. This Special
Issue aims to provide opportunities to investigators,
engineers and the public worldwide to exchange novel
ideas and disseminate knowledge and impactful
discoveries in this field. The scope of this Special Issue
includes empirical, theoretical, and numerical studies on
all emerging areas including (not limited to)
multidisciplinary heat and mass transfer, micro-and
nanoscale science, microfluidic, multiscale and
multiphysics modeling and simulation, advanced thermal
management techniques, manufacturing processes,
materials science, and engineering.

We invite scientists, researchers, and research scholars to
contribute to this Special Issue with innovative research
articles. In addition to research papers, we welcome state-
of-the-art and original research reviews on relevant topics.

Please scan the QR code for more information.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Energies is an international, open access journal in energy
engineering and research. The journal publishes original
papers, review articles, technical notes, and letters. Authors
are encouraged to submit manuscripts which bridge the
gaps between research, development and implementation.
The journal provides a forum for information on research,
innovation, and demonstration in the areas of energy
conversion and conservation, the optimal use of energy
resources, optimization of energy processes, mitigation of
environmental pollutants, and sustainable energy systems.
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