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Message from the Guest Editor

As we know, multiphase flow is widely encountered and
essential in energy and power engineering, chemical
engineering, aerospace engineering, biomedical
engineering, etc. In last 50 years, both academical and
practical achievements have been tremendous. However,
there are still great challenges in numerical simulation,
measurement techniques, and interdisciplinary research. It
is for this reason that we are launching this Energies
Special Issue titled “Challenges and Research Trends of
Multiphase Flow”, aiming to introduce recent advances on
simulation and measurement methods as well as
experimental work with applications in different fields.

The scope of this Special Issue includes but is not limited to
multiphase flow in fossil energy utilization, mass
production of renewable energy, biomedical engineering,
and measurement techniques. High-quality papers may be
eligible for discounts in this Special Issue.\
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Energies is an international, open access journal in energy
engineering and research. The journal publishes original
papers, review articles, technical notes, and letters. Authors
are encouraged to submit manuscripts which bridge the
gaps between research, development and implementation.
The journal provides a forum for information on research,
innovation, and demonstration in the areas of energy
conversion and conservation, the optimal use of energy
resources, optimization of energy processes, mitigation of
environmental pollutants, and sustainable energy systems.
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