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Message from the Guest Editors

With the increasingly obvious impact of climate change on
human economic and social activities, the urgency to
accelerate energy conservation and emission reduction
has become a major event in the developmental agenda of
all countries, with more than one hundred of them having
announced the policy goal of net-zero emissions, engaging
in a carbon neutrality race.

The policies favouring energy efficiency are profitable for
firms, capable of enhancing the economic green growth of
developing countries. At present, countries around the
world have accomplished great progress in green financial
standards, incentive mechanisms, disclosure requirements,
product systems, local pilot projects and international
cooperation.

What are the successful experiences all over the world and
how can they provide enlightenment and reference for
other parts of the world? What are the shortcomings and
lessons to be learned? This topic will thoroughly study
these topics and jointly contribute to the sustainable
development of the world.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Energies is an international, open access journal in energy
engineering and research. The journal publishes original
papers, review articles, technical notes, and letters. Authors
are encouraged to submit manuscripts which bridge the
gaps between research, development and implementation.
The journal provides a forum for information on research,
innovation, and demonstration in the areas of energy
conversion and conservation, the optimal use of energy
resources, optimization of energy processes, mitigation of
environmental pollutants, and sustainable energy systems.
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