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Message from the Guest Editor

Forest ecosystems provide numerous services essential to
human welfare such as fuel, building material, flood
control,air and water purification and carbon
sequestration. Forests are under increasing pressure due to
anthropic activities, including urbanization,sylviculture and
intensive agriculture. Climate change and the introduction
of pests and diseases are seriously threatening forest
health. Forest functioning and ecosystem services are
highly dependent on forest biodiversity. It is thus of
paramount importance to accurately describe and monitor
forest biodiversity to predict the impact of human activities
on forest functions. Major constraint on traditional large-
scale biodiversity inventories is the need to identify species
using morphological characteristics and laborious and
time-consuming techniques. It can also be difficult to
identify the different stages of certain species and to detect
rare and/or cryptic species. We welcome all studies aiming
at studying forest ecosystems biodiversity using
metabarcoding,to promote a more generalized usage of
this promising technique and help the development of
standardized protocols that are easily transferable across
laboratories.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Forests (ISSN 1999-4907) is an international and cross-
disciplinary, scholarly forestry journal. The distinguished
editorial board and refereeing process ensures the highest
degree of scientific rigor and review of all published
articles. Original research articles and timely reviews are
released online, with unlimited free access.

Our goal is to have  Forests be recognized as one of the
foremost publication outlets for high quality, leading edge
research in this broad and diverse field. We therefore invite
you to be one of our authors, and in doing so share your
important research findings with the global forestry
community.
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