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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Forest pests and diseases have diverse negative impacts on
the forestry economy, ecosystem service, biodiversity, and
sustainable ecosystem management. Monitoring their
occurrence and the assessment of their impacts are a first
step to effectively manage forest pests and diseases. It
provides basic knowledge about forest pests and diseases,
as well as proper management methods. Based on the
data from monitoring programs, new methods for
monitoring, assessing impacts, and developing
management techniques could be developed. To provide a
better understanding of the structure and processes in the
forest ecosystems, and to provide fundamental
information for effective management of forest pests and
diseases, this Special Issue will accept studies from broad
research topics related to impacts, monitoring, and
management of forest pests and diseases, including case
studies, methods, theories, and models.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Forests (ISSN 1999-4907) is an international and cross-
disciplinary, scholarly forestry journal. The distinguished
editorial board and refereeing process ensures the highest
degree of scientific rigor and review of all published
articles. Original research articles and timely reviews are
released online, with unlimited free access.

Our goal is to have  Forests be recognized as one of the
foremost publication outlets for high quality, leading edge
research in this broad and diverse field. We therefore invite
you to be one of our authors, and in doing so share your
important research findings with the global forestry
community.
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