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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

The geographical ranges of plants in the world depend on
many factors. One of the most important over the millennia
has been, and is, the climate. The disappearance or
expansion of the area covered by woody species as the
foundation of forest ecosystems largely affects other
species of plants, animals or fungi, and contributes to
changes in the microclimate, matter circulation, and
others. As a result of climate change, many species are
doomed to extinction, and others may seize the
opportunity to enlarge the area that they currently occupy.
In both cases, scientists and foresters are faced with the
challenges of properly preparing for these changes,
examining them, trying to predict their effects,
counteracting them and supporting selected species in
expansion.
The aim of the Special Issue will be to explore different
aspects of forest ecology and biology, evolution and
biogeography of woody plant species.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Forests (ISSN 1999-4907) is an international and cross-
disciplinary, scholarly forestry journal. The distinguished
editorial board and refereeing process ensures the highest
degree of scientific rigor and review of all published
articles. Original research articles and timely reviews are
released online, with unlimited free access.

Our goal is to have  Forests be recognized as one of the
foremost publication outlets for high quality, leading edge
research in this broad and diverse field. We therefore invite
you to be one of our authors, and in doing so share your
important research findings with the global forestry
community.
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