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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

We have seen advances in healthcare over the years, with
the majority of this due to the development of technologies
whose underlying knowledge is in fundamental areas such
as signal processing and machine learning. Practical and
innovative approaches in biomedical signal processing and
modeling for addressing everyday problems are critical in
this context.

This Special Issue of the journal Healthcare provides you
with the opportunity to disseminate the findings of your
research that highlight innovative aspects of biomedical
signal processing and/or modeling in healthcare.
Applications such as patient monitoring, disease diagnosis
and progression, patient rehabilitation, and medical image
analysis are encouraged. It is expected that you clearly
indicate the novel aspects of signal processing or modeling
that assisted you in solving your problem.
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Editor-in-Chief Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Healthcare is an international, scientific, peer-reviewed,
open access journal on health care systems, industry,
technology, policy, and regulation, and is published
semimonthly online by MDPI. Ocular Wellness & Nutrition
Society (OWNS) is affiliated with Healthcare and its
members receive discounts on article processing charges.
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