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Message from the Guest Editors

This Special Issue focuses on the continuum of health care
supported by digital technologies: from disease screening
and detection in the community, to triage, and clinical
decision support, as well as electronic medical records in
health facilities, central health information systems
enabling ministries of health, and public health
departments for exploring disease trends and making data-
driven decisions. We invite submissions of articles that offer
evaluations of digital tools in these settings—integration
and interoperability of systems—enforcing good so6ware
development standards and practices, as well as ethical
and data security challenges surrounding their
development, implementation, and use. We accept most
types of articles: conventional research articles, reviews,
case reports, and commentary/viewpoints, and encourage
the submission of high-quality, descriptive and hypothesis-
generating papers focusing on innovative so6ware features
and functionalities, as well as digital health landscape
analyses.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration among
clinicians and public health researchers. Discovery and
advances in this  research field play a critical role in
providing a scientific basis for decision-making toward
control and prevention of human diseases, especially the
illnesses that are induced from environmental exposure to
health hazards. IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of
discoveries and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields.
Please consider publishing your research in this high
quality, peer-reviewed, open access journal.
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