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Message from the Guest Editors

COVID-19, with its clear epidemiological and social
virulence, has triggered behavioral reactions, typical of
health emergencies, which in a short period of time have
significantly affected the health care model of our country.
Indeed, all efforts have been directed, on one hand, toward
slowing down the spread of infection and, on the other
hand, assisting citizens affected by this disease in the best
possible way. All this “works” in the short term with the
primary objective of restoring social life and returning to
“normal” as soon as possible. However, a health and social
system aspiring to lay the foundations for real economic,
organizational, and financial sustainability in a time of
crisis must be able to provide itself with a vision in terms of
programming and planning, which goes beyond the mere
logic of the emergency and therefore of the short term,
looking at the challenges awaiting in the medium and long
term.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration among
clinicians and public health researchers. Discovery and
advances in this  research field play a critical role in
providing a scientific basis for decision-making toward
control and prevention of human diseases, especially the
illnesses that are induced from environmental exposure to
health hazards. IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of
discoveries and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields.
Please consider publishing your research in this high
quality, peer-reviewed, open access journal.
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