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Message from the Guest Editor

HIV-1 provokes an extreme immune dysfunction. HIV-1
infection is associated with CD4 lymphopenia and
decreased lymphoproliferation together with the
impairment of critical immune functions. The immune
events, negatively affected by HIV-1, are cytokine and
human leukocyte antigen (HLA) expression, cellular
chemotaxis, phagocytosis and intracellular killing in
cytoplasmic granules, and the observation of neutropenia,
reduced natural killer (NK)-mediated cytotoxicity, and B-
lymphocyte numbers that produce nonspecific
immunoglobulins (Igs) with impoverished antibody (Ab)
responses.

Viral control could be the consequence of an interplay
between virus infectiveness and immune responses which
are conceivably more efficient against HIV-1 bearing non-
functional Env. Therefore, this Special Issue is focused on
immune and viral events that lead to progression or
natural control of HIV-1 infection, especially considering
new research works and review articles that update the
knowledge in this field.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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