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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Percutaneous coronary intervention (PCI) has been widely
used for acute coronary syndrome (ACS). However,
restenosis has always remained to be a major concern for
the effectiveness and complication of PCI. Although the
development of drug eluting stents (DESs) has significantly
reduced the restenosis rate down to 5-20% of patients a0er
PCI as compared to bare metal stents (BMS), intervention
or prediction of restenosis still remains to be an important
issue to maintain the life quality of patients receiving PCI.
Novel DES with even lower restenosis rate or
pharmacological approaches to prevent restenosis or
identification of precise risk factors leading to restenosis
are all awaiting further exploration. This Special Issue
"Pathological Mechanisms Involved in Restenosis
Progression" will call for papers with outstanding findings
to eliminate the incidence of restenosis or to identify
biomarkers for the prediction of restenosis.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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