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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Process mining has matured significantly in the past
decade and is now being used extensively in academia and
industry. With its beginnings in process discovery, process
mining has grown to be used for performance analysis,
conformance checking, variant analysis, concept dri2, as
well as predictive and prescriptive monitoring. However,
the main objective of all kinds of process analysis is to
improve business processes.

 

The aim of this Special Issue is to seek high-quality
submissions that specifically focus on using process mining
for business process improvement. The scope includes, but
is not restricted to, model-driven methods (using event
logs to identify patterns where improvements can be
made); process mining frameworks or approaches (the
development and validation of process mining methods
that structure up and systematize the identification of
improvement opportunities); case-based approaches; or
approaches that, based on event logs, consider business
process modelling, heuristics, robotic process automation,
or intelligent process automation for improving business
processes.

an Open Access Journal by MDPI

Process Mining for Business Process Improvement

6.92.4

mdpi.com/si/139741 SpecialIssue

https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100223111
/journal/information/stats
https://mdpi.com/si/139741
https://www.mdpi.com/si/139741
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100223111
/journal/information/stats


Editor-in-Chief
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Australia

Message from the Editor-in-Chief

The concept of Information is to disseminate scientific
results achieved via experiments and theoretical results in
depth. It is very important to enable researchers and
practitioners to learn new technology and findings that
enable development in the applied field.

Information is an online open access journal of information
science and technology, data, knowledge and
communication. It publishes reviews, regular research
papers and short communications. We invite high quality
work, and our review and publication processing is very
efficient.
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