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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Image stitching, alignment, and segmentation are
common image processing steps in biomedical processing
tasks, which are attracting more and more computer vision
researchers’ attention. Although many conventional
methods and machine-learning-based methods have been
proposed to solve those problems, challenges still exist,
e.g., 1) varied image quality (especially for some medical
images); 2) large data size (may be terabyte to petabyte
level); 3) high-precision requirement in biomedical
scenarios. Thus, more advanced algorithms for image
stitching, alignment, and segmentation are urgently
needed.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

The concept of Information is to disseminate scientific
results achieved via experiments and theoretical results in
depth. It is very important to enable researchers and
practitioners to learn new technology and findings that
enable development in the applied field.

Information is an online open access journal of information
science and technology, data, knowledge and
communication. It publishes reviews, regular research
papers and short communications. We invite high quality
work, and our review and publication processing is very
efficient.
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