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Message from the Guest Editors

Accounting for approximately 1% of all new cancers
diagnoses globally, so( tissue and bone sarcomas are rare
malignant tumors. As such, generating high-quality
evidence for diagnosis and treatment is challenging. The
heterogeneity of these tumors has hindered the
development of robust, evidence-based treatment
strategies, and therapeutic approaches are neither patient-
specific nor widely standardized. In the past several
decades, emerging state-of-the-art approaches and
concepts, including but not limited to transdisciplinary
collaboration, targeted therapy, personalized surgical
planning, and 3D printing, have attracted a great deal of
curiosity regarding musculoskeletal tumors. The aim of this
Special Issue is to underline the value of state-of-the-art
approaches for musculoskeletal tumors and to provide an
overview on emerging topics in the multidisciplinary
management of these diseases. We encourage submissions
focusing on new clinical methods and tools for diagnosis
and treatment as well as on new concepts based on
clinical evidence.
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Message from the Editorial Board

There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated to
providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed articles
covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical medicine.
The journal publishes concise, innovative, and exciting
research articles as well as clinically significant articles and
reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of disciplines
within medicine. The articles published are relevant to both
primary care physicians and specialists. The journal’s full-
texts are archived in PubMed Central and indexed in
PubMed. Please consider submitting your manuscripts for
publication to our journal and check us out on-line!
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