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Message from the Guest Editors

Physical activity are common forms of activity aimed at
improving overall fitness, wellbeing, and health both in
healthy people as well in people with chronic diseases.
Over the last decade, many regular types of physical
activity researches with large prospective cohorts have
been conducted. The risk of morbidity and mortality has
been reduced by 30% to 40% as a result of exercise.
Studies related to physical activity mainly analyze variables
such as the type and order of effort or exercise, intensity,
training volume, and frequency as well as duration of rest
intervals. However, the effectiveness of different training
methods in the development of physical fitness and
prevention is also associated with an appropriate diet and
supplementation, adapted to individual needs. Due to the
importance of training and nutrition in public health, it is
important to investigate and understand the influence of
different training methods, nutrition, and its acute and
chronic impact on health, anti-aging promotion. This
Special Issue will welcome studies related to the impact of
physical activity and nutrition concepts on acute and
chronic changes in physical fitness and health.
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Message from the Editorial Board

There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated to
providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed articles
covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical medicine.
The journal publishes concise, innovative, and exciting
research articles as well as clinically significant articles and
reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of disciplines
within medicine. The articles published are relevant to both
primary care physicians and specialists. The journal’s full-
texts are archived in PubMed Central and indexed in
PubMed. Please consider submitting your manuscripts for
publication to our journal and check us out on-line!
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