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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Clinical guidelines are written by an expert panel and used,
as their name implies, to help guide the treatment of
patients daily. The writing of guidelines requires a long
process and as such, the guidelines can o(en be outdated
on specific topics when they are published. Moreover,
different societies (such as the American heart association
and the European society of cardiology, together with the
relevant surgical societies) o(en publish discrepant
guidelines on the same topic, leading physicians to
dilemmas in clinical decision making. In this Special Issue,
we will touch on the guidelines in mitral and tricuspid valve
surgery, hurdles to their implementation in different
settings, differences between American and European
guidelines and use of mechanical valves in the real world
compared to the guidelines, attempting to anticipate
future directions the guidelines may take with the possible
use of new technological tools, such as artificial
intelligence.  
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Message from the Editorial Board

There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated to
providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed articles
covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical medicine.
The journal publishes concise, innovative, and exciting
research articles as well as clinically significant articles and
reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of disciplines
within medicine. The articles published are relevant to both
primary care physicians and specialists. The journal’s full-
texts are archived in PubMed Central and indexed in
PubMed. Please consider submitting your manuscripts for
publication to our journal and check us out on-line!
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