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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

In recent years, the field of reproductive medicine has
witnessed a profound transformation, propelled by a
convergence of scientific breakthroughs, societal shi7s,
and evolving cultural norms. This dynamic landscape has
ushered in an era of unprecedented possibilities and
challenges in the realm of fertility diagnosis and treatment.
This Special Issue seeks to unravel the multifaceted
perspectives of this evolving landscape, illuminating key
trends and critical issues that are reshaping the way we
perceive, diagnose, and address fertility concerns. We will
bring together a diverse array of perspectives
encompassing the latest research, clinical insights, and
delve into the scientific advancements aimed at preserving
reproductive potential and ensuring healthier outcomes
for women and couples navigating the complex terrain of
infertility.
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Message from the Editorial Board

There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated to
providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed articles
covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical medicine.
The journal publishes concise, innovative, and exciting
research articles as well as clinically significant articles and
reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of disciplines
within medicine. The articles published are relevant to both
primary care physicians and specialists. The journal’s full-
texts are archived in PubMed Central and indexed in
PubMed. Please consider submitting your manuscripts for
publication to our journal and check us out on-line!
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