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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear colleagues,

Following the success of the first edition of the Special
Issue "Advances in Marine Propulsion", this second Issue
aims to promote and publish new findings and
technologies related to marine propulsion. Researchers are
cordially invited to contribute findings and progress in the
broader areas of marine and ocean engineering with
emphasis on marine propulsion, power, energy and
renewables as well as autonomous systems and
watercra., ocean robotics, mechatronics,
electromechanics, dynamics and control.

The fields of research may include, but are not limited to,
the following: digital signal processing, control theory,
process modeling and simulation, system identification,
dynamics and control, reliability and signal and data
analysis.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

T h e Journal of Marine Science and Engineering (JMSE;
ISSN 2077-1312) is an international peer-reviewed open
access journal which provides an advanced forum for
studies related to marine science and engineering. The
journal aims to provide scholarly research on a range of
topics, including ocean engineering, chemical
oceanography, physical oceanography, marine biology and
marine geosciences. We invite you to publish in our journal
sharing your important research findings with the global
ocean community.
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