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Message from the Guest Editor

The coronavirus, SARS-CoV-2 is pathogenic to humans and
may be associated to severe acute respiratory syndrome,
SARS. Its presence may be asymptomatic or in the
coronavirus disease 2019 (COVID-19), symptoms may range
from mild to severe.

SARS-CoV-2 may also be associated with non-respiratory
clinical features. The Journal of Personalized Medicine is
now opening a Special Issue that is fully dedicated to the
related complications such as immune
perturbation/cytokine storm, Kawasaki disease-like form,
viral coagulopathy, pulmonary embolism, stroke-
neurological, multiorgan failure and impact of SARS-CoV-2
genomic variability on symptoms.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Journal of Personalized Medicine (JPM; ISSN 2075-4426) is
an international, open access journal aimed at bringing all
aspects of personalized medicine to one platform. JPM
publishes cutting edge, innovative preclinical and
translational scientific research and technologies related to
personalized medicine (e.g., precision medicine,
pharmacogenomics/proteomics, systems biology, ‘omics
association analysis). JPM is covered in Scopus, the
Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE), PubMed, PMC,
Embase, and other databases.
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