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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

The coronavirus disease 2019 (COVID-19) pandemic has
held the world in its thrall since early March 2020 and,
unfortunately, it still represents a very difficult challenge.

The purpose of this Special Issue is to provide an overview
of several concerns related to COVID-19 syndrome and
address questions regarding clinical management,
including the proper utilization of healthcare resources.

Particular attention will be focused on therapeutic
appropriateness and the use of pharmacological and
complementary approaches useful to care for both
infected patients and patients showing post-COVID
sequelae.

This Special issue is open to both reviews and original
research papers targeting any of these topics.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Journal of Personalized Medicine (JPM; ISSN 2075-4426) is
an international, open access journal aimed at bringing all
aspects of personalized medicine to one platform. JPM
publishes cutting edge, innovative preclinical and
translational scientific research and technologies related to
personalized medicine (e.g., precision medicine,
pharmacogenomics/proteomics, systems biology, ‘omics
association analysis). JPM is covered in Scopus, the
Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE), PubMed, PMC,
Embase, and other databases.
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