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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Skin cancers, including basal cell carcinoma, squamous
cell carcinoma, and melanoma, have continued to rise
globally over the past few decades, and statistics have
shown that skin cancer is one of the three most common
forms of cancer. Fortunately, novel, more effective
treatments for various types of skin cancer are in
development, and early diagnosis and the exploration of
innovative treatments are particularly important.

This Special Issue will focus on recent advances in skin
cancer prevention, diagnosis, and treatment and the latest
insights gained by clinical researchers, with a focus on how
to personalize these new advances in clinical practice.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Journal of Personalized Medicine (JPM; ISSN 2075-4426) is
an international, open access journal aimed at bringing all
aspects of personalized medicine to one platform. JPM
publishes cutting edge, innovative preclinical and
translational scientific research and technologies related to
personalized medicine (e.g., precision medicine,
pharmacogenomics/proteomics, systems biology, ‘omics
association analysis). JPM is covered in Scopus, the
Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE), PubMed, PMC,
Embase, and other databases.
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