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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Postoperative complications are invariably an important
topic concerning patients treated in various surgical
departments. This Special Issue, entitled “Postoperative
Complications and Personalized Medicine”, aims to
provide insight into the issue of individualizing the
approach to individual patients or standardized groups of
patients. Due to the extent of the subject matter, it was
decided to limit it to urology and general surgery. We
would like to devote special attention to the issue of
personalizing perioperative care in elderly patients
undergoing surgery for oncological conditions. Another
aim of this issue is to emphasize the importance of
individual assessment of the results of surgical treatment in
homogeneous groups of patients. Attention is also given to
the use of appropriate management algorithms and
questionnaires for assessing the effectiveness and quality
of surgical treatment.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Journal of Personalized Medicine (JPM; ISSN 2075-4426) is
an international, open access journal aimed at bringing all
aspects of personalized medicine to one platform. JPM
publishes cutting edge, innovative preclinical and
translational scientific research and technologies related to
personalized medicine (e.g., precision medicine,
pharmacogenomics/proteomics, systems biology, ‘omics
association analysis). JPM is covered in Scopus, the
Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE), PubMed, PMC,
Embase, and other databases.
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