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Message from the Guest Editor

Since the global financial crisis of 2008, the markets for
credit instruments have witnessed a burgeoning growth.
Corporate and municipal bond markets account for the
preponderance of non-sovereign finance not only in the
major U.S. and European markets but also in emerging
Asian markets. Mortgage-related instruments have been
the central banks’ instruments of choice to implement
unconventional quantitative easing. Innovative credit
instruments have been created to shore up banks’ capital a
world over. At the same time, a host of regulations such as
Dodd-Franks in the U.S. or Basel III globally, have changed
the landscape of credit risk management. Nevertheless, the
unrelenting advent of credit instruments makes the big
picture that much more complicated.

In this Special Issue, we aim to understand how the
interplays amongst credit risk packaging and trading,
financial innovations, and regulatory changes have shaped
the landscape of credit risk management and pricing.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Researchers are most welcome to contribute original
research articles or comprehensive review papers for
consideration and publication in Journal of Risk and
Financial Management (JRFM), an on-line, open access
journal. JRFM adheres to rigorous peer-review as well as
editorial processes, and publishes high quality manuscripts
that address theoretical, practical and empirical issues in
analysing real life financial data. The goal of JRFM is to
enable rapid dissemination of high impact research to the
scientific community.
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