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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Recent years have seen an increased focus on the interplay
between energy economics, finance and sustainability. In
exploring these interactions, many papers have put
forward ideas that focus on minimising energy usage from
traditional sources with an implied mitigation of economic
activity. In addition, much work has tended to look
upstream from the end user rather than considering the
economic, financial and associated social impacts at the
point of use from a consumer perspective.

In this Special Issue, we are seeking contributions that can
speak to these issues from both global as well as local
perspectives. We are particularly interested in papers that
give consideration to fundamental underlying economic
rationales and profitability, as well as the impact of energy
policy changes on individuals and small business.
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Editor-in-Chief
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Researchers are most welcome to contribute original
research articles or comprehensive review papers for
consideration and publication in Journal of Risk and
Financial Management (JRFM), an on-line, open access
journal. JRFM adheres to rigorous peer-review as well as
editorial processes, and publishes high quality manuscripts
that address theoretical, practical and empirical issues in
analysing real life financial data. The goal of JRFM is to
enable rapid dissemination of high impact research to the
scientific community.
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