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Message from the Guest Editors

To build healthy and sustainable human settlement
involves considerations across various domains, including
environmental, social, and economic factors. Cultural
factors influence how people perceive and use the land,
while ecological factors affect the sustainability and health
of ecosystems. The inherent ecological and cultural
connections in our perception of the land play a crucial
role in how we perceive and utilize the land. Landsenses, or
the sensory experiences derived from interacting with the
land, encompass a wide range of perceptions including
sight, sound, smell, taste, and touch. The concept
represents the emotional, sensory, and cognitive
connections between humans and the land.
Understanding and respecting landsenses can lead to
better conservation and utilization of land resources,
fostering harmonious coexistence between humans and
nature. Incorporating landsenses into the design and
planning of human settlements is essential for promoting
both environmental stewardship and cultural preservation.
We believe that the ecological and cultural connations of
landsenses provide a holistic framework for building
healthy and sustainable human settlements.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Land is the only open access journal covering all aspects of
land science, and it is a pioneering platform for publishing
on land system science. Our editorial board is comprised of
eminent scholars. We publish high quality research on
societally relevant, emerging and innovative topics and
results in land system research. It is now one of the top
land journals with a significant impact factor, and has a
goal to become the best journal in land in the coming
years. I strongly recommend Land for your best research
publications for a fast dissemination of your research.
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