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Message from the Guest Editors

This is a challenge where polymer–wood-fibre-reinforced
composites offer significant opportunities to exploit raw
material resources and produce high-added-value material
composites that provide a societal solution, saving
resources and emissions and ultimately making the
polymer composite material as attractive and best
qualified as a neat polymer.

There is a need to tune the structural changes in the
properties of wood–polymer composites (molecular
weight, Mw, chain scission, crystal structure, (trans)
crystallisation behaviour) that cause changes in thermal
properties (melting temperature, crystallisation) as well as
rheological, mechanical, and surface behaviour; adding
new functionalities also provides motivation for future
tailoring.

Focusing on multifunctional properties in a wide range of
applications such as automotive, aerospace, packaging,
construction and transportation, the Special Issue, entitled
Towards a Sustainable and Recyclable Future with Wood
and Wood-based Composites, will present the latest
developments in polymer wood-based composites.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials, thin
films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon materials,
materials chemistry, materials physics, optics and
photonics, corrosion, construction and building materials,
materials simulation and design, electronic materials,
advanced and functional ceramics and glasses, metals and
alloys, soG matter, polymeric materials, quantum
materials, mechanics of materials, green materials,
general. Materials provides a unique opportunity to
contribute high quality articles and to take advantage of its
large readership.
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