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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear colleagues,

In the last few years, energy harvesting from various
sources has attracted a growing attention because of the
actual demands in replacing fossil fuels.

This Special Issue is a timely approach to survey recent
progress in area of ferroelectric and piezoelectric
composites materials and their applications. The articles
presented in this Special Issue will cover various topics,
ranging from materials design by using theoretical models,
theoretical approach and the production of ferroelectric
and piezoelectric materials with enhanced FOMs,
functionalization, functional properties and their various
applications, such as sensors (energy harvesting, chemical,
biological, gas, and so on), fuel cell, electronic devices, and
so on. Certainly, the coverage is not complete, but it is our
intention that this Special Issue will contribute to
improving the knowledge concerning the functional
(electric, ferroelectric, piezoelectric, pyroelectric)
properties of advanced ferroelectric and piezoelectric
materials and their possible applications.

It is our pleasure to invite you to submit review articles,
original papers, and communications for this Special Issue.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials, thin
films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon materials,
materials chemistry, materials physics, optics and
photonics, corrosion, construction and building materials,
materials simulation and design, electronic materials,
advanced and functional ceramics and glasses, metals and
alloys, so@ matter, polymeric materials, quantum
materials, mechanics of materials, green materials,
general. Materials provides a unique opportunity to
contribute high quality articles and to take advantage of its
large readership.
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