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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

The recovery of solid waste is a challenge and an
opportunity for companies, thanks to the ongoing
awareness of sustainability and technological advances.
The end-of-waste criteria is a European strategic goal that
promotes recycling, to ensure a high level of environmental
protection by means of quantities reduction of waste
destined for disposal.

This Special Issue aims to promote the knowledge of
technological methods for solid waste recovery. Papers are
invited to investigate innovative processing methods with
the goal of valorizing solid waste form different civil and
industrial activities. Topics may include studies on
construction and building, mining, plastic, WEEE referring
to the treatment techniques used and, where appropriate,
the critical raw materials that can be valorised. The
recovery processes of critical raw materials can be very
energy-intensive, affecting environmental and soil aspects.
Case studies on sustainable, low carbon and resource-
efficient development for the purpose of a more
competitive economy are also very welcome.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials, thin
films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon materials,
materials chemistry, materials physics, optics and
photonics, corrosion, construction and building materials,
materials simulation and design, electronic materials,
advanced and functional ceramics and glasses, metals and
alloys, soA matter, polymeric materials, quantum
materials, mechanics of materials, green materials,
general. Materials provides a unique opportunity to
contribute high quality articles and to take advantage of its
large readership.
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