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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

This Special Issue of Materials is open to papers focusing
on recent developments in the field of targeted drug
delivery, either for nanometric (e.g., liposomes, micelles,
inorganic nanoparticles, virus like particles, artificial cells)
or molecular (antibodies and their fragments, penetrating
peptides, etc.) carriers. Contributions reporting image-
guided approaches of targeted drug delivery are also
welcome. Our intention is to awaken the material science,
chemistry, and biology communities to the role of targeted
drug delivery systems in the rise of molecular and
personalized medicine. Thus, we would be very glad if you
consider contributing to this issue by submitting an article
(review, research paper, or communication) in one of the
topics mentioned above. We are certain your contribution
will be inspiring to other scientists engaged in this
flourishing field, which will most definitely contribute to the
development of more efficient and more selective
anticancer therapies in the years to come.

For more information, please click this link:

https://www.mdpi.com/journal/materials/special_issues/targetd_drug_delivery
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials, thin
films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon materials,
materials chemistry, materials physics, optics and
photonics, corrosion, construction and building materials,
materials simulation and design, electronic materials,
advanced and functional ceramics and glasses, metals and
alloys, soC matter, polymeric materials, quantum
materials, mechanics of materials, green materials,
general. Materials provides a unique opportunity to
contribute high quality articles and to take advantage of its
large readership.
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