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Message from the Guest Editors

Distant education has undergone some development and
has a strong position in the current system of education in
various types of schools, especially universities. In the
current situation, when the world is in the Covid-19
pandemic (in 2020), many ordinary work activities are being
moved to the online environment, not excluding
education. The educational process requires student-
teacher interaction. However, in the time of online
education, this possibility is significantly absent. Distant
education using modern technologies is proving to be a
substitute.

Now the online (distant) teaching in the time of the world
pandemic is very actual and possibly the one method for
providing the full lectures. Educators face a great
challenge, as in teaching online, without contact with
students, to clearly explain various topics. One of the
suitable forms seemed to be the visualization and
animation of formal methods and algorithms using
educational software.

This Special Issue will accept high-quality papers with
original research results in theoretical research, and recent
progress in the study of applied problems in science and
technology.
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Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Francisco Chiclana
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

The journal Mathematics publishes high-quality, refereed
papers that treat both pure and applied mathematics. The
journal highlights articles devoted to the mathematical
treatment of questions arising in physics, chemistry,
biology, statistics, finance, computer science, engineering
and sociology, particularly those that stress
analytical/algebraic aspects and novel problems and their
solutions. One of the missions of the journal is to serve
mathematicians and scientists through the prompt
publication of significant advances in any branch of
science and technology, and to provide a forum for the
discussion of new scientific developments.
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