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Message from the Guest Editor

Female pelvic floor dysfunctions (PFDs) are common
conditions that affect over 20% of the adult population.
These disorders, which include urinary incontinence, anal
incontinence, pelvic organ prolapse, and sexual
dysfunction, represent serious health problems for the
female population.

As women continue to live longer lives, understanding how
to promote dialogues between clinicians and patients
around these issues and finding therapies to reduce its
effect on women’s quality of life should be a priority for
future research. Moreover, it is important to develop the
concept of a multidisciplinary approach to PFDs, which, in
recent years, has led to the improvement of the condition
for women.

In this Special Issue, we would like to provide a collection
of papers, original articles, or clinical/systematic reviews
aimed at providing a comprehensive overview of the recent
advances in the diagnosis and treatment of PFDs.

This Special Issue is the continuation of the Special Issue
"New Advances in Female Pelvic Floor Dysfunctions
Management"
(https://www.mdpi.com/journal/medicina/special_issues/Female_Pelvic_Floor_Dysfunctions
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication in
Medicina (ISSN: 1648-9144). Medicina is an open access,
peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes original
articles, critical reviews, research notes, and short
communications on medicine. The scientific community
and the general public can access the content free of
charge as soon as it is published.
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