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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

Many diet-related chronic diseases such as diabetes,
cardiovascular disease, and certain cancers,
disproportionately impact groups of a particular race,
ethnicity, gender, socioeconomic status, religion,
immigration status, sexual orientation or gender identity,
age, cognitive and/or physical disability, and geographical
location. Equitably addressing health disparities will
require approaches (e.g., interventions, policies, etc.) that
consider the contexts of the most impacted populations.
This will require a greater understanding of the contextual
factors that support or hinder health-promoting actions
(e.g., healthy eating, being physically active, engaging in
routine medical care for disease prevention and
management, etc.) and using this knowledge to develop
solutions that appropriately address these factors.

For this Special Issue, we are seeking papers that examine
the relationships between contextual factors and nutrition
and/or health in populations impacted by health
disparities. We also welcome papers exploring specific
approaches (e.g., interventions-at any stage, policies,
strategies, etc.) developed for these populations.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Nutrients is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2009. Nutrients adheres to rigorous peer-
review and editorial processes and publishes only high
quality manuscripts that address important issues related
to the impacts of nutrients on human health. The Impact
Factor of Nutrients has risen rapidly since its establishment
and it is now ranked in the first quartile of journals
publishing in the field of nutrition and dietetics research.
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