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Message from the Guest Editors

Dietary assessment is an important part of nutritional
status evaluation. And accurately assessing diet has always
been a challenge. With the widespread use of smartphones
and the development and popularization of mobile apps
and wearables, the monitoring and assessment of dietary
intake is becoming less burdensome, and the methods of
dietary intake assessment have also developed more and
more rapidly.
The purpose of this Special Issue is to collect research on
new methods for monitoring and assessing dietary intake,
as well as current research progress, including the
assessment of differences in nutrient and energy intake
among different groups, and determining the risk of
insufficient or excessive nutrient intake. In addition, papers
assessing the relationships between lifestyle, physical
activity and dietary intake, the consumption of certain
food, the relationship between eating habits and eating
quality are welcome for submission. Of particular interest
are studies reporting on new technologies and objective
methodologies for the assessment of dietary intake,
including wearables, image-based methods, and the
discovery of dietary biomarkers of intake using
metabolimics.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Nutrients is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2009. Nutrients adheres to rigorous peer-
review and editorial processes and publishes only high
quality manuscripts that address important issues related
to the impacts of nutrients on human health. The Impact
Factor of Nutrients has risen rapidly since its establishment
and it is now ranked in the first quartile of journals
publishing in the field of nutrition and dietetics research.
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