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Message from the Guest Editor

It has been established that the colonization of the gut in
early infancy may have long-term health effects. The goal
of this Special Issue, “Diet and Nutritional Intervention for
the Infant Gut Microbiome II”, is to focus on the importance
of nutrition as a major driver of gut microbiome
composition, diversity, and functional capacity.

Given the dynamic development of the gut microbiome in
infants and children, the aim of this Special Issue is to
clarify if diet and nutritional interventions can influence gut
microbiota, favoring overall health and preventing
diseases.

Considering the success of the previous Special Issue, "Diet
and Nutritional Intervention for the Infant Gut Microbiome
", we are pleased to announce that we are launching a
second Special Issue on this topic. This Special Issue on
“Diet and Nutritional Intervention for the Infant Gut
Microbiome II” will continue to provide healthcare
professionals with clear and updated evidence on the
modulation of intestinal gut microbiota in pediatrics based
on diet and nutritional schemes.
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Message from the Editorial Board

Nutrients is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2009. Nutrients adheres to rigorous peer-
review and editorial processes and publishes only high
quality manuscripts that address important issues related
to the impacts of nutrients on human health. The Impact
Factor of Nutrients has risen rapidly since its establishment
and it is now ranked in the first quartile of journals
publishing in the field of nutrition and dietetics research.
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