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Message from the Guest Editor

Latin America is a multicultural region, which encompasses
43 countries, and it was the settlement of many pre-
Hispanic civilizations.  Latin America has many endemic
medicinal plants. In Latin America, the use of medicinal
plants for primary healthcare is a common practice among
the general population due to the lack of/insufficient
medical attention and the lack of economic resources.
Many of these medicinal plants remain to be studied for
their toxicology, pharmacology, and chemistry. This
Special Issue will be focused on the following topics: (i)
ethnobotanical studies using quantitative tools, (ii) survey-
based studies about self-medication/use of herbal
products, (iii) preclinical and clinical studies with plant
extracts and their active compounds, (iv) analytical
procedures for the standardization of plant extracts, and (v)
legislation and regulation of herbal products. The journal
Pharmaceuticals invites experts to contribute to this
Special Issue with reviews and original research articles
focusing on the pharmacology, toxicology, analytical
chemistry, pharmacy, and ethnobotany of medicinal plants
endemic to Latin America.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current work,
in the form of a research article or a review, in the open
access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.

Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are peer-
reviewed and a final decision is provided to authors within
4–6 weeks aBer submission. Papers are published on the
web immediately aBer acceptance. For details on the
submission process or any other matter, please do not
hesitate to contact us.

We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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