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This Special Issue aims to create a platform for the
exchange of ideas and findings related to treatments for
tumors in the central nervous system (CNS). The current
shortage of disease-modifying treatments for patients
with both primary and metastatic brain tumors
represents one of the most significant unmet needs of
our time. Our ability to effectively tap into otherwise-
promising anti-cancer therapies is challenged by the
blood–brain barrier, which severely restricts the entry of
systemic/orally delivered therapeutic agents into the
brain. We seek innovative thoughts, research, and
approaches to tackling critical questions relevant to the
treatment of debilitating brain tumors. This Special Issue
aims to highlight the latest advances in treatments with
transformative potential in neuro-oncology from experts
in relevant fields such as pharmaceutical sciences,
neuroscience, pharmacology, medical oncology, drug
delivery, and clinical neuro-surgery. Along with original
research articles, we encourage authors to submit
comprehensive up-to-date reviews that detail the
current status of these treatments and that provide
perspectives or future directions.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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