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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

With the development of AI, a novel research field has
emerged, known as “philosophy of artificial intelligence”. In
this field, we not only focus on technological development
of AI, but also address the philosophical issues. AI involves
almost all traditional fields of philosophy and has recently
received more attention from ethics and aesthetics.
Algorithmic justice, trustworthy AI, and AI art making all
warrant exploration.

Although AI continues to achieve unimaginable success
that seems to surpass human beings, man–machine
integration and the metaverse may provide new spaces to
avoid elimination and enhance ourselves. Thus, we also
want to investigate: how does AI relate to them?

The goals of this frontier forum and this Special Issue of
Philosophies are: (1) to respond philosophically to the
rapid development of artificial intelligence, man–machine
integration, and the metaverse, as well as illuminate some
cross-cutting areas; (2) to excavate some ethical and
reliable development strategies for AI; and (3) to promote
the academic communication between philosophers and
AI researchers.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Philosophies searches for the syntheses of philosophical
and scientific inquiries. It promotes philosophical work that
is derived from the experience of diverse scientific
disciplines and cultures. Multiple philosophies already exist
— those of logic, information, computation, natural and
artificial life, natural or artificial intelligence, complexity,
technology, etc. Our mission is not to abandon
philosophical roots and traditions of inquiry, but to
promote the development of philosophical foundations
and effective methodologies derived from diverse scientific
explorations, and intended to enhance these explorations
as to generate deeper and more holistic knowledge.
Innovation may also be achieved through the cultural
dimension. Other cultures can offer from their heritage a
diversity of resources for exploration; these resources can
also contribute to the emergent synthesis of philosophical
inquiry.
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